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PRECINCT VENDOR 

One RK Hall, LLC 

Richard Drake 

One Construction Co. LP. 

One Austin Asphalt 

Unique Paving 
One Materials Corp. 

Vulcan Construction 
One Materials, LLC. 

Reynolds Asphalt and 
One Construction Company 

Two RK Hall, LLC 

Richard Drake 

Two Construction Co. LP. 

Two Austin Asphalt 

Unique Paving 

Two Materials Corp. 

Vulcan Construction 
Two Materials, LLC 

Reynolds Asphalt and 

Two Construction Company 

Bid# 253-24 

HUNT COUNTY 
BID AWARD 

FORMAL BID NO. 253-24, ASPHALT HOT AND COLD MIX 
Effective 9/24/24 - 9/23/25 

-
COLD MIX PRICE 

HOT MIX PRICE PER HOT MIX PRICE PER PER TON COLD MIX PRICE PER 
TON DELIVERED TON PICKED UP DELIVERED TON PICKED UP 

$91 .00 $85.00 $91.00 $85.00 

$123.80 $93.00 $118.80 $95.80 

$96.39 $84.39 $157.00 $145.00 

NO BID NO BID $141 .00 $118.00 
**SEE PRICING 

NO BID NO BID BELOW **SEE PRICING BELOW 

$95.50 $86.00 NO BID NO BID 

$91.00 $85.00 $91 .00 $85.00 

$121 .50 $93.00 $116.50 $95.80 

$96 .39 $84.39 $157.00 $145.00 

NOBID NO BID $143.37 $118.00 

**SEE PRICING 

NO BID NO BID BELOW **SEE PRICING BELOW 

$95.50 $86 .00 NO BID NO BID 

FILED FOR RECORD 
at ;;t:/$,- o'clock p M 

SEP 10 2024 
OCf"'l<V I A.,,-,.,,,, Iii 

By 
County ~ um~- -:;J;~~-ov. 

..,. ICC:, 
....... - ·-

PICK - UP POINT PIGGYBACK 
nwy ,,<+, ureenv11Ie, 

TX YES 
221 CR 12530, Paris 

TX 75462 YES 

Farmersville Plant 
#405 - 2315 East 

Audie Murphy 
Parkway, Farmersville, 

TX 75422 YES 
Martin Merietta 

Materials, 1795 TX-
101 Bridgeport, TX 

76426 NO 
FM 1022/Hwy 90 

West, Dabney, TX NO 
3045 CR 2172, 

Greenville TX 75402 YES -
Hwy 224, Greenville, 

TX YES 
221 CR 12530, Paris 

TX 75462 YES 

Farmersville Plant 
#405 - 2315 East 

Audie Murphy 
Parkway, Farmersville, 

TX 75422 YES 
Martin Merietta 

Materials, 1795 TX-
101 Bridgeport, TX 

76426 NO 
FM 1022/Hwy 90 

West, Dabney, TX 
78801 NO 

3045 CR 2172, 
Greenville TX 75402 YES 
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Three RK Hall, LLC $91 .00 

Richard Drake 
Three Construction Co. LP. $121 .70 

•· 

Three Austin Asphalt $96.39 

Unique Paving Material 

Three Corp. NOBID 

Vulcan Construction 

Three Material, LLC NOBID 

I 
Reynolds Asphalt and 

Three Construction Company $95.50 

FOUR RK Hall, LLC $91 .00 
Richard Drake 

FOUR Construction Co. LP. $117.40 

FOUR Austin Asphalt $96.39 

Unique Paving Material 

FOUR Corp. NO BID 

Vulcan Construction 
FOUR Material, LLC NO BID 

Reynolds Asphalt and 
FOUR Construction Company $95 .50 

I 
Bid# 253-24 

HUNT COUNTY 
BID AWARD 

FORMAL BID NO. 253-24, ASPHALT HOT AND COLD MIX 
Effective 9/24/24 - 9/23/25 

$85.00 $91 .00 $85.00 

$93.00 $116.70 $95 .80 

$84.39 $157.00 $145.00 

NO BID $147.46 $118.00 

NO BID **SEE PRICING BELOW **SEE PRICING BELOW 

$86.00 NO BID NO BID 

$85.00 $91 .00 $85.00 

$93.00 $112.30 $95.80 

$84 .39 $157.00 $145.00 

NO BID $148 .32 $118.00 

NO BID **SEE PRICING BELOW **SEE PRICING BELOW 

$86.00 NO BID NOBID 

Hwy LL4, Greenville , 
TX YES 

221 CR 12530, Paris 
TX 75462 YES 

Farmersville Plant 
#405 - 2315 East 

Audie Murphy 
Parkway, Farmersville , 

TX 75422 YES 
Martin Merietta 

Materials, 1795 TX-
101 Bridgeport, TX 

76426 NO 
FM 1022/Hwy 90 

West, Dabney, TX 
78801 NO 

3045 CR 2172, 
Greenville TX 75402 YES 

Hwy 224, Greenville, 
TX YES 

221 CR 12530, Paris 
TX 75462 YES 

Farmersville Plant 
#405 - 2315 East 

Audie Murphy 
Parkway, Farmersville, 

TX 75422 YES 
1V1amn 1V1enena 

Materials, 1795 TX-
101 Bridgeport, TX 

76426 NO 
FM 1022/Hwy 90 

West, Dabney, TX 
78801 NO 

3045 CR 2172, 
Greenville TX 75402 YES 
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HUNT COUNTY 
BID AWARD 

FORMAL BID NO. 253-24, ASPHALT HOT AND COLD MIX 
Effective 9/24/24 - 9/23/25 

**Vulcan Construction Materials LLC 

Celeste, TX- Delivered Price TYDS+ $174.97 & TYO+ $176.97 

Caddo Mills , TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ $170.37 & TYO+ $172.37 

Lone Oak, TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ $172.21 & TYO+ $174.21 

Commerce, TX - Delivered Price TYDS+ $176.35 & TYO+ $178.35 

**Austin Asphalt 

Pickup TYDS+ $74.00 & TYO+ $76.00 

Pickup TYDS+ $74.00 & TYO+ $76.00 

Pickup TYDS+ $74.00 & TYO+ $76.00 

Pickup TYDS+ $74.00 & TYO+ $76.00 

Precinct 1, 2, 3 and 4 -Asphalt mix avaliable during normal plant operating hours - Hot Mix TxDot 340 spec-Type DI Cold Mix TxDot 9202 spec. 

Hot Mix B34 340 spec Type D -Cold Mix TxDOT 9202 spec. -Please see Trucking Rates/Guidelines that may apply for less than 3 Rounds - A day per truck for delivery. 

**Unique Paving Materials Corp. 

Precinct 1, 2, 3, and 4 - Additional Pricing *U PM® High Performance Cold Mix* 

**Reynolds Asphalt & Construction Company 

Plant will be available beginning December 2024. 

The Purchasing Department recommends the award of this bid to all bidders in accordance with LGC§262-027 (e) 
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